
731-336-7856
http://www.takeout2unow.com

Panda Express Vann Dr Jackson
Please Note:

This is a non-participating restaurant
and TakeOut 2 You is not affiliated
with this restaurant in any way. We

provide a delivery service only, acting
as your concierge or pick up agent.
By ordering online from TakeOut 2

You you are agreeing to our terms &
conditions and authorize we to pay
for, collect and deliver your order to
you. We will call you if a menu price
has changed or if an item has been
dropped from the menu. Website

prices vary from dine-in prices. *We
do not prepare your food or your

order and we are not responsible for
mistakes made by the restaurant on
your order or quality and preparation

of your food.* We simply transport
your order in our insulated carriers to
preserve freshness and ensure food

is kept as warm/cold as possible
during our delivery. Our driver will
contact you to inform you of any

delay in delivery times. Questions?
Call 731-336-7856. Thank you and

happy ordering!

Appetizers
Chicken Egg Roll $2.36
Vegetable Spring Rolls (2) $2.36
Cream Cheese Rangoon

Sides
Chow Mein
Fried Rice
Super Greens
White Steamed Rice

Meals
Bowl $7.73

1 entree & 1 side.
Plate $9.54

2 entrees & 1 side.
Bigger Plate $11.36

3 entrees & 1 side.

Party Packs
The best way to feed a group.?Premium

entrees are an additional $1.25
upcharge.

Small Pack $119.59
2 entrees & 2 sides. Serves 12-16

people.
Family Feast $41.07

3 large entrees & 2 large sides.
Serves 4-5 people.

Medium Party Pack $167.91
3 entrees & 3 sides. Serves 18-22

people.
Large Party Pack $216.23

4 entrees & 4 sides.

A La Carte Boxes
Small $5.19
Medium $9.18
Large $12.44

Drinks
Drinks
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